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Signitture of Authoriied Qfferor 

(H:/RFP  3-2008) 

oatte 

Vendor's Offer 
Form 201-B (RFP) 

"Return this Section with your Response" 

It is required that Offeror complete, sign and submit the original of this form to the City Procurement Office with the 
proposal response. An unsigned "Vendor's Offer", late proposal response and/or a materially incomplete response will be 
considered nonresponsive and rejected. 

Offeror is to type or legibly write in ink all information required below. 

Company Name: 	KeNCe.) 04 L_ Lc 	A  h  

Company Mailing Address: 	Po ao---/<  

L54- LT-1)-TS 

City:  6-010 01V_A/C  State: 	 Zip:  &5338  

Phone No.: 	q8'ZY FAX:  ,6 	93i .-5-1(-q 5 E-mail: 	Stt.,)6. 	L.541 - 1_1G-1+TS 0:04 

Company Tax Information: 

Arizona Transaction Privilege (Sales) Tax No.: 	A- 0 9C...1 1 	1 	i3 	or 

— 
Arizona Use Tax No.: 	  

1-1?— Federal I.D. No.: 

City & State Where Sales Tax is Paid: 	Goo cyNt 	 , 

If a Tempe based firm, provide Tempe Transaction Privilege (Sales) Tax No.:  ----- 

THIS PROPOSAL IS OFFERED•BY 

Name of Authorized Individual (TYPE OR PRINT IN INK) 

Title of Authorized Individual (TYPE OR PRINT IN INK) 

KEANI 5 A Ni 	c) 

REQUIRED SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED OFFEROR (MUST SIGN IN INK) 

By signing this Vendor's Offer, Offeror acknowledges acceptance of all terms and conditions contained herein and that 
prices offered were independently developed without consultation with any other Offeror or potential Offeror. In 
accordance with A.R.S. 35-393, et seq., the Offeror hereby certifies that it does not have scrutinized business operations in 
Iran or Stylja'. Failure to sigiyAnd retuis,npis form with proposal response will be considered nonresponsive and rejected. 

/00//s 
Date 
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Specifications — Sedan 
Return this Section with your Response 

Below are the minimum specifications for the uplifting of a General Motors Police Patrol Sedan. 

Substitutions will be evaluated but may not be approved until tested for conformity by the City of Tempe. 

Any exceptions to the specifications must be explained. 

The City may choose an outright purchase of equipment or the purchase of equipment and installation. Not all listed 
services may be required on all vehicles. 

It is the intent of this REP that awarded vendor have the capabilities to provide a turnkey vehicle package. Any item not 
mentioned shall not be interpreted as not requested — vendor is to provide all required components, provide quality 
installation with a factory finish appearance and provide a "work ready vehicle" as part of their pricing. 

The City may request purchase of and/or installation of items not specifically identified below. Pricing shall be based 
upon quoted discounts from manufacturers catalogs and established labor rate. 

Vendor is to supply a detailed quote for each build, as specified by the City of Tempe, prior to beginning work on any 
vehicle. 

	 Vehicle Wiring 	 . 	. 	  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions 	 
a 	Wiring 	harness 	shall 	be 	factory 	wiring 	per 	vehicle 	X 

manufacturer police package for equipment in the front of 
vehicle.  

b All wiring and switches to be sized to amperage draw of the 	X 
lights and accessory loads.  
All switches utilized in builds must be 12 volt 	 X  

d 	All connectors to be butt type, soldered and heat shrink used 	X 
on all splices.  

e 	All wiring to be loomed. 	 X  
f Any point where wiring passes through metal the wiring to be 	X 

protected by a loom or a rubber grommet and water sealant.  
g Wiring loom to be secured to the vehicle a minimum of every 	X 

eighteen inches (18"). Wire loom ties that are "stick on" type 
are not acceptable.  

h 	All wired components and looms must be in the same physical 	X 
location in all vehicles to aid with diagnostic work by the City. For 
multiple builds of similar vehicles, connector must be of the same 
type, size and polarity direction for relative locations to allow easy 
switching of components between units.  

i 	A copy of the wiring diagram used during the build design to 	X 
be provided to the City of Tempe for diagnostic reference for 
every vehicle build type.  

j 	DR Electronics Power Distribution Unit (PDU) #PDU42-4T3 	X 
mounted in the cab near the remaining emergency equipment 
with power supplied by GM factory police package wiring.  
Brand and Model offered 	D&R PDU42WB  

k 	PDU will be the power supply for radio, which will be located 	X 
adjacent to PDU and siren controller. 	Vendor will be responsible 
for installation of supplied radio equipment to specific locations 
when applicable. 
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I 	Power leads to all console mounted equipment to be of 
adequate length to allow for removal and troubleshooting 
without the need to remove wire connections.  

m All electrical components provided and installed by the 	X 
vendor to be wired and operational 	in Tempe specific 
locations when applicable.  

n Power cable for radio will be provided by the City — vendor 	X 
will be responsible for installation in DR Electronics PDU 
fuse bank terminated in a 24" service loop on the vehicle 
floor between the driver's and passenger's seat.  

o The console will consist of Havis 8" console (C-LP-2) with 	X 
two 12 VDC power outlets.  
Brand and Model offered 	Havis C-LP-2  

Decals 
	  Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a Vendor to supply and install decals on each unit according to 	X 

the City of Tempe vehicle graphics standard as shown in 
Exhibit A.  

b Decals and graphic material to be 3M brand or approved 	X 
equal.  
Brand and Model offered  3114l reflective vinyl.  

 	Emergency -Lighting 	.  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Front Wig-Wag — units will be provided to the contracted 	X 

vendor with factory installed wig-wag. 	Vendor will utilize 
factory supplied police package headlight flasher and wiring.  

b 	Rear Wig-Wag — Rear taillights will be controlled by the 	X 
factory police package flasher module provided from vehicle 
manufacturer.  

c Light Bar - Tempe specific Tamar 970 Scorpion, or approved 	X 
equivalent, light bar appropriate to specific vehicle size. City 
of Tempe will detail specific lighting modules, locations and 
flash patterns when applicable.  
Brand and Model offered 	Tomar 970L-4409-ME02  

d 	vendor to supply the light bar mounting kit and all necessary 	X 
hardware and materials. The light bar wiring harness, where 
it passes through the roof of the vehicle, to be protected by a 
rubber grommet and sealed against water intrusion. 	When 
using both Tomar, or approved equivalent, light bar and siren 
controller, use manufacturer specific cable configuration and 
mounting hardware.  

e Trunk Lid Lights - Vendor will install four Tomar RECT-14, 	X 
or approved equivalent, (2 red, 2 blue) LED lights that will 
shine through the opening of an open trunk. Any outer lights 
facing upward will be turned off when trunk/lift gate is open 
and turned on when closed and in position 1,2 or 3 when 
applicable.  
Brand and Model offered 	Tomar RECT-14LS-RR and REC.-  T-14LS-BB  

f 	Push Bumper Lights — Two Tomar RECT-25, or approved 	X 
equivalent, mounted at a 45° angle, horizontal on the push bumper 
and parallel to the road. 
Brand and Model offered Tomar RECT-25CLSLCB-R & RECT-25CLSLCB-B 
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:Siren :604:$0.eakei.":  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Siren Controller — Tamar 948L, or approved equal, remote 	X 

mount full feature siren with light controls, horn-ring, park 
kill feature and PA. 	Unit to include plug in microphone and 
grade 8 stainless steel hardware for a single 100 wan speaker.  
Brand and Model offered Tomar 948L-SIREN-R SPK-100 SPEAKER  

b Auxiliary Siren — A Whelen Howler system per vehicle build 	X 
with manufacturer supplied cables and grade 8 stainless steel 
hardware.  
Brand and Model offered 	Whelen HWLCC11 (one speaker)  

c 	Tomar 948L, or approved equal, remote mount full feature 
siren with light controls, horn-ring, park kilt feature and PA. 
Unit to include plug in microphone and mounting hardware.  
Brand and Model offered 	See 4A  

Position 0 —No emergency lights.  
ii 	Position I — All rear facing lights including WIG/WAG, 	X 

auxiliary lights, light bar rear red/blue in Tempe specific 
flash pattern  

iii 	Position 2 — All emergency red/blue lights flashing in 	X 
Tempe specified flash pattern (no white lights while 
parked).  

iv 	Position 3 — Siren on if in gear, refer to park kill feature, 	X 
all emergency lights including whic lights (white lights 
on while in drive, off in park) minus alley lights. 

Optional: 	preemption available upon request, 
will be tied into position three on siren controller 
and will deactivate when put in park.  

v 	Panel backlighting that tracks vehicle instrument panel 	X 

intensity powered off of PDU for one hour.  . 	... 	. 	.. 
OUSOIej::  

Vendor Response  
Specification 	 Yes 	No . 	Exceptions '.:..  

a  Havis 8 inch console (model C-LP-2) or approved equal. 	X  
Brand and Model offered Havis C-SM-814  

b 	Havis, or approved equal, base plate for specified vehicle 	X 

delivered to vehdor  
Brand and Model offered 	Havis C-TMW-CAPR-01  

c 	Havis, or approved equal, accessory pieces to mount laptop dock to 	X 
.  provide proper viewing angle and insure safe operation of airbags  
Brand and Model offered Havis C-MD-102  

d Havis Dock # DS-PAN-11-2 or 112-2, or approved equal, 	X 
with dual pass thru and auto lock and LIND power supply.  
Brand and Model offered HAVIS DS-PABN-112-2 (power 	X 

supply included)  
e 	Two Havis microphone clips # C-MCB with one magnetic 	X 

microphone clip for the radio on the drivers side of the console and 
one hard mounted clip for the PA microphone on the passenger side 
of the console. Details on specific mounting will be detailed by the 

.  City of Tempe  
Brand and Model offered Havis C-MOB & C-MG  

6: 	:::Radid did:MDT:A:den:ha::: _....._..... 	......,.,....... ....... ._ 	- 	  
Vendor Response 	E 

28 RFP #14-049 



Specification Yes Exceptions 
a X 

X 

X 

Exceptions Specification 

See exhibit D for location of antenna 

j
e City staff will conduct the final connection to the radio 

antenna. 
Push--  Bumper . 

Vendor to supply and install front mounted push bumpers. a X 

I minimum. 
. 	. 	. 

Interior Lighting  

Specification 

Brand and Model offered 
. 	 ......, 

9 

Specification 

Whelen 60CREGCS 

Vendor Response  
Exceptions No Yes 

X 

X 

Exceptions 

City will provide all radio antennas with required cable  
City will provide vendor with radio or radio mounting 
equipment for installation.  
Installation of one (1) NMO style antenna on roof using 
Motorola HAF4017. Cable is to be routed down passenger 
side of vehicle. Radio cable will terminate next to radio with 
a 24" service loop. 
Install one (1) Antenna Plus AP-Cell/LTE/GPS cellular, 4G 
and GPS antenna with matching body color (black or white 
depending on mounting location) routed to the computer 
docking station. Cellular on the A side and GPS on the B side 
of the dock. 

X 

X Push bumpers to be Setina push bumper # PB-300, or 
approved equal, and to be certified as air bag compliant.  

Selina PB-300 
Push bumper mounting bolts to be grade 8 stainless steel 
Brand and Model offered 

j 

Map/Dome Light — A Whelen #60CREGCS, or approved 
equal, universal red/white LED dome light. The light will 
operate with an independent light mounted on off switch and 
should not be wired to operate with the vehicle door switches.  

Units will be supplied to the contracted vendor with a full size 
spare tire. If full size spare does not fit flush in spare tire 
compartment in trunk, the vendor to mount to the spare on the 
trunk shelf. The factory spare wheel well is to be equipped by 
the vendor with a PVC type divider that will provide three 
individual storage compartments. 
Pro-Gard  TO53CC11 spare compartment organizer  

b Fire Extinguisher and Roller Tape Holder to be constructed of 
PVC pipe (8" long piece of 2" pipe and 4" long piece of 6" 
pipe) per Tempe specifications — a sample is available at the 
fleet maintenance yard. 

. 	. 	. 
:.Ror,Vatt-rtion/Prisoner lir4nwpq:$qat.fogi: 

a X 

a 

Vendor Response 
Specification Yes 
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a 	Supply and install a Selina, or approved equal, cage. The 	X 
caged area will be the entire rear passenger area. It will 
include seat, floor pan, door panels and window bars on both 
sides of the vehicle.  
Brand and Model offered SETINA CRP 10,  

b Install 	NHTSA 	approved 	Prisoner 	Transport 	System 	X 
including ABS seat, floor pan, ABS door panels and seat belts 
Setina, or approved equal, full transport seat.  
Brand and Model offered Selina 10CRP Partition. Pro-gard S53CC11 Seat, FP53CC1.1 floor pan, WB53CC11 
bars, & DP53CC11 door panels. 
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Specifications — Tahoe Patrol Vehicle 
Return this Section with your Response 

Below are the minimum specifications for the upfitting of a Chevrolet Tahoe SUV Patrol Vehicle. 

Substitutions will be evaluated but may not be approved until tested for conformity by the City of Tempe. 

Any exceptions to the specifications must be explained. 

The City may choose an outright purchase of equipment or the purchase of equipment and installation. Not all listed 
services may be required on all vehicles. 

It is the intent of this RFP that the awarded vendor have the capabilities to provide a turnkey vehicle package. Any item 
not mentioned shall not be interpreted as not requested — vendor is to provide all required components, provide quality 
installation with a factory finish appearance and provide a "work ready vehicle" as part of their pricing. 

The City may request purchase of and/or installation of items not specifically identified below. Pricing shall be based 
upon quoted discounts from manufacturers catalogs and established labor rate. 

Vendor is to supply a detailed quote for each build, as specified by the City of Tempe, prior to beginning work on any 
vehicle. 

- 	Vehicle Wiring 	.  
 	Vendor Response 	  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Wiring 	harness 	shall 	be 	factory 	wiring 	per 	vehicle 	X 

manufacturer police package for equipment in the front of 
vehicle.  
All wiring and switches to be sized to amperage draw of the 	X 
lights and accessory loads  

c 	All switches utilized in builds must be 12 volt 	 X  
d 	All connectors to be butt type, soldered and heat shrink used 	X 

on all splices.  
.  e 	All wiring to be loomed. 	 X  

f Any point where wiring passes through metal the wiring to be 	X 
protected by a loom or a rubber grommet and water sealant.  

g Wiring loom to be secured to the vehicle a minimum of every 	X 
eighteen inches (18"). Wire loom ties that are "stick on" type 
are not acceptable.  

h 	All wired components and looms must be in the same physical 	X 
location in all vehicles to aid with diagnostic work by the City. For 
multiple builds of similar vehicles, connector must be of the same 
type, size and polarity direction for relative locations to allow easy 
switching of components between units.  

i 	A copy of the wiring diagram used during the build design to 	X 
be provided to the City of Tempe for diagnostic reference for 
every vehicle build type.  
Power Supply - DR Electronics Power Distribution Unit 	X 
(PDU) #PDU42-4T3 mounted in the cab near the remaining 
emergency equipment with power supplied by GM factory 
police package wiring.  
Brand and Model offered 	D&R PDU42WB 
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k 	PDU will be the power supply for radio, which will be located 	X 
adjacent to PDU and siren controller. 	Vendor will be responsible 
for installation of supplied radio equipment to specific locations 
when applicable.  
Brand and Model offered SEE 1J  

I 

	

	Power leads to all console mounted equipment to be of 	X 
adequate length to allow for removal and troubleshooting 
without the need to remove wire connections.  

	

m All electrical components provided and installed by the 	X 
vendor are to be wired and operational.  

	

n Power cable for radio will be provided by the City — vendor 	X 
will be responsible for installation in DR Electronics PDU 
fuse bank terminated in a 24" service loop on the vehicle 
floor between the driver's and passenger's seat.  

o 	The console will consist of Havis 8" console (C-LP-2) with 	X 
two 12 VDC power outlets.  
Brand and Model offered Havis C-LP-2 

Decals  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	NoExceptions  
a 

	

	Vendor to supply and install decals on each unit according to 	X 
the City of Tempe vehicle graphics standard as shown in 
Exhibit B.  

	

b Decals and graphic material to be 3M brand or approved 	X 
equal.  
Brand  and Model offered  

Emergency :  Lighting .  
Vendor Response 	 

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Front Wig-Wag — units will be provided to the contracted 	X 

vendor with factory installed wig-wag. 	Vendor will utilize 
factory supplied police package headlight flasher and wiring.  

b 

	

	Rear Wig-Wag — Rear taillights will be controlled by the 	X 
factory police package flasher module provided from vehicle 
manufacturer.  

c 	Light Bar - Tempe specific Toinar 970 Scorpion, or approved 	X 
equivalent, 	light bar appropriate to specific vehicle size. 
Rear of light bar will not be populated when using rear 
lighting.  
Brand and Model offered 	Tamar 9701,-5309-ME02  

	

d Vendor to supply the light bar mounting kit and all necessary 	X 
hardware and materials. The light bar wiring harness, where 
it passes through the roof of the vehicle, to be protected by a 
rubber grommet and sealed against water intrusion. 	When 
using both Tomar, or approved equivalent, light bar and siren 
controller, use manufacturer specific cable configuration and 
mounting hardware.  

e 

	

	Rear Access Lights — Vendor will install two lights on the bottom 	X 
of the rear access door. The rear access lights will be installed with 
a mercury switch and will only operate when rear access lift gate is 
open. 	Any outer lights facing upward will be turned off when 
trunk/lift gate is open and turned on when closed and in position 1,2 
or 3 when applicable. 
ECCO 3510R & 3510B Surface mount LED, SHO-ME 
05.0512.513 Mercury Switch 
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f 	Push Bumper Lights — Two Tomar RECT-25, or approved 	X 
equivalent, mounted at a 45 0  angle, horizontal on the push bumper 
and parallel to the road.  
Brand and Model offered 	Tomar RECT-25CLSLCB -R & RECT -25CLSLCB -B  

g 	Rear SUV Light Bar — Tomar Spider rear SUV light bar, or 	X 
approved equal, rear facing lights.  
Brand and Model offered 	Tomar Spider-TA H-01  

S iren and.Speaker.  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Siren Controller — Tomar 948L, or approved equal, remote 	X 

mount full feature siren with light controls, horn-ring, park 
kill feature and PA. Unit to include plug in microphone and 
grade 8 stainless steel hardware for a single 100 watt speaker.  
Brand and Model offered Toinar 948L -SIREN -R & SPK-100 speaker  

b Auxiliary Siren — A Whelen Howler system per vehicle build 	X 
with manufacturer supplied cables and grade 8 stainless steel 
hardware.  
Brand and Model offered 	Wise/en HOWLER  

i 	Position 0 —No emergency lights. 	 X  
ii 	Position 1 — All rear facing lights including WIG/WAG, 	X 

auxiliary lights, light bar rear red/blue in Tempe specific 
flash pattern  

iii 	Position 2 — All emergency red/blue lights flashing in 	X 
Tempe specified flash pattern (no white lights while 
parked).  

iv 	Position 3 — Siren on if in gear, refer to park kill feature, 	X 
all emergency lights including whie lights (white lights 
on while in drive, off in park) minus alley lights. 

Optional: 	preemption available upon request, 
will 	be 	tied 	into 	position 	three 	on 	siren 
controller and will deactivate when put in park.  

v 	Panel backlighting that tracks vehicle instrument panel 	X 
intensity powered off of PDU for one hour.  

Console 	 . 	  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Havis 8 inch console (model C-LP-2) or approved equal. 	X  

Brand and Model offered 	Havis C-SM-814  
b 	Havis, or approved equal, base plate for Chevy Tahoe 	X 	1  

Brand and Model offered Havis C-TMW-GMC-02  
c 	Havis, or approved equal, accessory pieces to mount laptop dock to 	X 

provide proper viewing angle and insure safe operation of airbags  

_ 	Brand and Model offered Havis C-MD-102 & C-HDM-208  
d Havis Dock # DS-PAN-11-2 or 112-2, or approved equal, 	X 

with dual pass thru and auto lock and LIND power supply.  
Brand and Model offered Havis DS -PAN-I12-2 (power supply included)  

e 	Two Havis microphone clips # C-MCB with one magnetic 	X 
microphone clip for the radio on the drivers side of the console and 
one hard mounted clip for the PA microphone on the passenger side 
of the console. Details on specific mounting will be detailed by the 
City of Tempe  
Brand and Model offered 	Havis C-MCB & C-MC 	. 

Radio Ancf -M.D. 1 . . Antenna .  
„ 
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Vendor Response  
Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	City will provide all radio antennas with required cable 	X  
b City will provide vendor with radio or radio mounting 	X 

equipment for installation.  
c 	Installation of one (1) NMO style antenna on roof using 	X 

Motorola HAF4017. 	Cable is to be routed down passenger 
side of vehicle. Radio cable will terminate next to radio with 
a 24" service loop.  

d 	Install one (1) Antenna Plus AP-Cell/LTE/GPS cellular, 40 	X 
and GPS antenna with matching body color (black or white 
depending on mounting location) routed to the computer 
docking station. 	Cellular on the A side and GPS on the B 
side of the dock.  
See exhibit D for location of antenna  

e 	City staff will conduct the final connection to the radio 	X 
antenna. 	 _ 

.._ 	I ush Bugler. 	. 	. ..._ . 
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Vendor to supply and install front mounted push bumpers.  
b Push bumpers to be Setina push bumper # PB-300, or 	X 

approved equal, and to be certified as air bag compliant.  
Brand and Model offered Selina PB 300  

c 	Push bumper mounting bolts to be grade 8 stainless steel 	X 
minimum.  

Interior I ,ighqiiie,  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	xceptions  
a Map/Dome Light — A Whelen #60CREGCS, or approved 	X 

equal, universal red/white LED dome light. The light will 
operate with an independent light mounted on off switch and 
should not be wired to operate with the vehicle door 
switches.  
Brand and Model offered Whelen #60CREGCS 

 	.ar Parfition/Prisotief 'Mill-sport  
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions  
a 	Partition 	— 	Vendor 	will 	supply 	and 	install 	an 	all 	X 

Polycarbonate on top with a sliding center section vehicle 
partition. Center opening to have an expanded metal cover 
It will include seat, floor pan, door panels and window bars 
on both sides of the vehicle. Setina Bodyguard #10-SC with 
recessed storage panel, or approved equal  
Brand and Model offered 	Selina 10SC RP  

b 	Install 	NHTSA 	approved 	Prisoner 	Transport 	System 	X 
including ABS seat, floor pan, ABS door panels and seat 
belts. Setina full transport seating, or approved equal.  
Brand and Model offered 	PRO-GARD S5702T07 seat with rear barrier, WBP57T07 window barrier, 
DP57T07 door panels 
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Specifications — Honda Motorcycle 
Return this Section with your Response 

Below are the minimum specifications for the upfitting of a Honda ST1300 Patrol Vehicle. 

Brand substitutions will be evaluated but may not be approved until tested for conformity by the City of Tempe. 

Any exceptions to the specifications must be explained. 

The City may choose an outright purchase of equipment or the purchase of equipment and installation. Not all listed 
services may be required on all vehicles. 

It is the intent of this RFP that awarded vendor have the capabilities to provide a turnkey vehicle package. Any item not 
mentioned shall not be interpreted as not requested — vendor is to provide all required components, provide quality 
installation with a factory finish appearance and provide a "work ready vehicle" as part of their pricing. 

The City may request purchase of and/or installation of items not specifically identified below. Pricing shall be based 
upon quoted discounts from manufacturers catalogs and established labor rate. 

Vendor is to supply a detailed quote for each build, as specified by the City of Tempe, prior to beginning work on any 
vehicle. 

	 :Vehic le : Wiri rig --: ._.. . ._ 	.. 
Vendor Response  

Specification 	 Yes 	No 	Exceptions 	.  
a 	Wiring harness, provided by the City of Tempe, to be 	 NO BID 

installed.  
b 	Breakaway cord, provided by the City of Tempe, to be 

installed  
c 	All wiring and switches to be sized to amperage draw 

of the lights and accessory loads  
d 	All switches utilized in builds must be 12 volt  
e 	All connectors to be butt type, soldered and heat 

shrink used on all splices.  
f 	All wiring to be loomed.  
g 	Any point where wiring passes through metal the 

wiring to be protected by a loom or a rubber gromme 
and water sealant.  

h All wired components and looms must be in t. - same 
physical location in all vehicles to aid with dial. ostic work 
by the City. For multiple builds of s ilar vehicles, 
connector must be of the same type size and polarity 
direction for relative locations to . ow easy switching of 
components between units.  

i 	A copy of the wiring di 	ram used during the build 
design to be provii ,- 0 	to the City of Tempe for 
diagnostic referen t. -  

j 	Setcom, or at n oved equal, Push to Talk system with 
wiring liar 	ss  
Brand ..nd Model offered  

k 	A. • DPDT switch with center off constant on to left 
. ad momentary (PTT) to the right.  
Battery 	tender 	1.5 	amp 	onboard 	battery 	 NO BID 
charger/maintainer 
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111 NO BID Add an illuminated rocker switch On/Off SPST for all 
accessory emergency equipment 
Brand and Model offered 

n 12 volt de power outlet with protective cap installed in 
right front faring compartment 

Vendor Response 
Yes I No I Exceptions  Specifitation . 

a Vendor to supply and install decals on each unit 
according to the City of Tempe vehicle graphics 
standard as shown in Exhibit C. 
Decals and graphic material to be 3M brand or 
approved equal.  
Brand and Model offered 

Yes..I No I pkceptions 
a Red LED Non-Flashing mounted on right side of 

faring 
Whelen, or approved equal, TIR3 super LED light 
head with built in flasher — RED mounted vertically 
on rear bracket 
Brand and Model offered 
Whelen, or approved equal, TIR3 super LED light 
head with built in flasher — BLUE mounted vertically 
on rear bracket 
Brand and Model offered 
Use only Code 3 Stop/Turn/Tail lights 
Ulite, or approved equal, with 3 super brig( LED in 
chrome plated housing attached to license pate. 
Brand and Model offered 
Headlight flasher (Wig Wag) 

Siren LAnd Speaker .  

Vendor Response  
Yes I No I Exceptions Specification 

a Installation of external speayer, Motorola SSN4020A 
(this will replace factory upit) 

.Radio and 'Antenna. 
Vendor Response 

Specification Yes I No I Exceptions 
a City will provideintennas with required cable 
b City will provi radio  
c Installation 	one (1) Motorola APX 7500 radio and 

antenna. 
mi-F:4110.0cou 	 . . 

SpecifieSion 
Vendor Response 

Yes I No I Exceptions  
a I Vser Lock Specialties radar holster 
b 1/Honda ST-1300 Dash Shelf 
VI Flashlight Holder 
d [Roll A Tape holder 
e 1 Front and Rear crash bars 
f 1 Heli bar riser NO BID 
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Proposal Questionnaire 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

Bidder shall submit answers to the following questions. Responses will be utilized in determination of contract award. 

Question 	 Response  
1 	Provide the address of the facility that will 	2100 W Obispo Ave 

provide services to the City of Tempe. 	Gilbert, AZ 85233  
a 	If you do not have a Tempe, or valley 

address, 	how 	do 	you 	intend 	to 	handle 
repair/warranty issues?  

b 	If your repair facility is not located within 	3 Miles 
Tempe, what is the distance of your facility 
to the border of Tempe?  

2 	Describe your company and its history — include 	See Attached Qualification Statement 
years in business  

3 	Please 	provide 	contact 	information 	for 	the 
primary account representative and a backup 
contact for the City of Tempe. 

• Contact Name 
• Phone Number 
• Cell Phone Number 
• e-mail address 	 Provide contact information below  

Steve Sangillo, Phone 623-535-9898, Cell 623-882-4654, 
steve@Ishlights.com   
Chris Young, Phone 623-535-9898, Cell 623-628-6037, 
cyoung@lshlights.eom  

4 	Describe your experience in upfitting of vehicles 	See Attached Qualification Statement 
— public safety and utility  

5 	What warranty will you provide on products and 	Product manufacture warranty 
workmanship? 	 Five year workmanship warranty  
a 	What are your operating hours for drive up 	By appointment. Monday — Friday 8:00AM — 2:00PM 

warranty service?  
6 	Do you have factory-trained personnel on site to 	Yes 

perform installation, maintenance and repair on 
the equipment you are offering?  

7 	What is the value of your local inventory and 	$60.00 average inventory 
what percentage of your local inventory are parts 	20% Equipment Specific, can be adjusted 
for the equipment offered?  

8 	Based on a 10 car up-fitting order — Chevy 	30 Days 
Impalas — state your anticipated delivery time 
after receipt of cars and Purchase Order  
a 	What is your shop capacity? 	 22 Vehicles  
b 	What percentage of maximum capacity do 	80% 

you typically see in your shop?  
9 	Do you have factory "drop ship" numbers? 	. 

a 	Ford 	 No — Applied for  
b GM 	 Yes  
c 	Daimler Chrysler 	 Yes  

10 	Will 	you 	provide 	pick-up 	and 	delivery 	of 	Yes, for new vehicles 
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vehicles for upfitting work at no additional cost 
to the City?  
Will 	you 	provide 	pick-up 	and 	delivery 	of 	No, must be delivered to Gilbert Facility 
vehicles for warranty work at no additional cost 
to the City?  

11 	Provide your available credit lines for the primary 
vendors that would be utilized in work for the City of 
Tempe — This information will be considered 	Firm 	 Credit Line  

confidential 	and 	not 	released 	as 	a 	public 	Tomar 	 $ Unlimited  
document of in the event of a public record 	 $  
request 	 $  

LSH Lights is certain that credit levels are sufficient 	 $ 
to meet your specification.  

12 	Do you agree to the Terms and Conditions of 	Yes 
this RFP?  
a 	If No, explain  

13 	List three (3) governmental or large corporate 
references 	for which you currently provide 
similar services. 

• Firm Name 
• Contact Name 	 Provide Reference Information Below  
• Phone Number 	 City of Mesa, Dan Baker, 480-644-2817  

City of Goodyear, Charles Schneider, 623-882-7195  
City of Surprise, Danny Ontiveros, 623-222-6020 
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Pricing 
Return this Section with your Response 

Pricing shall be inclusive of all items requested in the specifications section, however, it is the responsibility of the 
submitting vendor to provide all required components, provide quality installation with a factory finish appearance and to 
provide a "work ready vehicle" as part of their pricing. 

Not all item groups may be requested for each vehicle. 

	

Group 1 - 	Police Patrol Car 	 Costs 

Individual Component Group Costs 	 Parts 	Labor 	Total  
Vehicle Wiring 	 $ 343.96 	$ 197.50 	$ 541.46  

	

2 	Decals 	 $ 425.00 	$ 175.00 	$ 600.00  
Light Bar 	 $ 1375.00 	$ 158.00 	$ 1533.00  

	

4 	Siren and Speaker 	 $ 1147.40 	$ 98.75 	$ 1246.15  
5 	Console 	 $ 1494.43 	$ 98.75 	$ 1593.18  

	

6 	Radio and Antenna 	 $ 0 	$ 79.00 	$ 79.00  

	

7 	Push Bumper 	 $ 263.20 	$ 79.00 	$ 342.20  

	

8 	Interior Lighting 	 $ 112.69 	$ 19.75 	$ 132.44  

	

9 	Auxiliary Emergency Lighting 	 $ 270.48 	$ 79.00 	$ 349.48  

	

10 	Trunk Storage 	 $ 283.85 	$ 39.50 	$ 323.35  

	

11 	Anti-Theft (Tremco Police Products) 	 $ 115.00 	$ 79.00 	$ 194.00  
Complete Build Cost 	$ 6934.26  

Options  

	

12 	Trunk Lid Lights 	 $ 369.65 	$ 79.00 	$ 448.65  

	

13 	Prisoner Divider (Partition only) 	 $ 583.20 	$ 118.50 	$ 701.70  

	

14 	Prisoner Transport System 	 $ 1385.90 	. $ 197.50 	$ 1583.40  

	

15 	Vendor is to provide pricing for the purchase of individual decal pieces (part cost only) - include 
information on separate sheet. 

Group 2- Tahoe Patrol Vehicle 	 Costs  
Complete Build 	 Parts 	Labor 	Total  

1 	Vehicle Wiring 	 $ 343.96 	$ 197.50 	$ 541.46  
2 	Decals 	 $ 425.00 	$ 175.00 	$ 600.00  
3 	Light Bar 	 $ 1375.00 	$ 158.00 	$ 1533.00  
4 	Siren and Speaker 	 $ 1230.59 	$ 98.75 	$ 1329.34  
5 	Console 	 $ 1515.98 	$ 118.50 	$ 1634.48  
6 	Radio and Antenna 	 $ 0 	$ 79.00 	$ 79.00  
7 	Push Bumper 	 $ 303.20 	$ 79.00 	$ 382.20  
8 	Interior Lighting 	 $ 112.96 	$ 19.75 	$ 132.71  
9 	Auxiliary Emergency Lighting 	 $ 1157.96 	$ 197.50 	$ 1355.46  
10 	Anti-Theft (Tremco Police Products) 	 $ 115.00 	$ 79.00 	$ 194.00  

Complete Build Cost 	$ 7709.65  
Options  
11 	Prisoner Divider (Partition only) 	 $ 671.20 	$ 118.50 	$ 789.70  
12 	Prisoner Transport System 	 $ 1045.96 	$ 237.00 	$ 1282.96  
13 

	

	Vendor is to provide pricing for the purchase of individual decal pieces (part cost only) - include 
information on separate sheet. 
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Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

	

Group 3 - Motorcycle 	 Costs  

	

Complete Build 	 Parts 	L .e; 	 Total  
1 	Vehicle Wiring 	 $ 	 $  
2 	Decals 	 $ 	 $ 	 $  
3 	Lighting 	 $ 	 $ 	 $  
4 	Siren & Speaker 	 $ 	 $ 	 $  
5 	Miscellaneous 	 $ 	 $ 	 $  

Complete Build Cost 	$ NO BID  
Options  

6 

	

	- - lor is to provide pricing for the purchase of individual decal pieces (part cost only) - include 
information on separate sheet. 

Group 4- Utility/Service Vehicles 	 Costs  
Parts 	Labor 	Total  

1 	Ecco 7960A or approved equal 	 $ 167.05 	$ 79.00 	$ 246.05  
Brand and Model offered  

2 	Ecco 7160A or approved e ual 	 $ 170.85 	$ 79.00 	$ 249.85  
Brand and Model offered  

3 	Ecco 3710 or approved equal (obsolete) 	 $ 85.42 	$ 39.50 	$ 124.92  
Brand and Model offered Ecco 3715  

4 	Ecco 3730 or approved equal 	 $ 67.21 	$ 39.50 	$ 106.71  
Brand and Model offered  

5 	Ecco 3810 or approved equal (obsolete) 	 $ 59.83 	$ 39.50 	$ 99.33  
Brand and Model offered Ecco 3811  

6 	Whelen TA1252L or approved equal (Pickup only) 	$ 1131.62 	$ 158.00 	$ 1289.62  
Brand and Model offered  

7 	Whelen TA1652L or approved equal (Pickup only) 	$ 1263.19 	$ 158.00 	$ 1421.19  
Brand and Model offered  

8 	Superior Signal SY810LED or approved equal 	 $ 690.80 	$ 158.00 	$ 848.8  
Brand and Model offered SHO-ME 02.6134  

9 	Ecco 3300 series, or approved equal (obsolete) (Pickup 	$ 443.95 	$ 158.00 	$ 601.95 
only)  
Brand and Model offered Ecco 3410  

10 	Sound off ETHFSS-SP, or approved equal headlight wig 
wag 	 $ 36.85 	$ 79.00 	$ 115.85  
Brand and Model offered  

11 	Sound off ETFBSSN-P, or approved equal, taillight 
flasher 	 $ 40.70 	$ 79.00 	$ 119.70  
Brand and Model offered  

12 	Inyati spray in bed liner or approved equal (pricing per 
square foot) 	 _ $ 	 , $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

13 	Go industries 51592, or approved equal, headache rack 	$ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered 

14 	Go industries 20652, or approved equal, headache rack 	$ 	 $ 	_ $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

15 	Weather Guard 126-X-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered 
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Kustom Signals 
Jotto Desk, Inc. 
Setina Manufacturing 

7 
8 
9 

Patriot Enterprises USA 
Copeland Engineering 

12 
13 
14 
15 
16 
17 
18 

Group 6 --.-Discottrit :from. Publisher] Price. Lists :. 
Vendor 

PSE, Code 3, Inc 
Federal Signal Corporation  
Whelen 

Discount Offered 
40% 
35% 

41% 
4 
5 
6 

10 
11 

Sound Off 
American Aluminum Inc 
Radiotronics 

Gamber Johnson 
AOI Electrical Inc. 
David Clark Inc 
Tomar Electronics 
Viper Alarms 
iData Link 
STI-Co 

15% 
25% 
20% 
45% 

5% 

5% 
30% 
25% 
30% 
21% 
10% 
35% 
25% 
10% 
10% 

1 
2 
3 

Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

16 	Weather Guard 125-X-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

17 	Weather Guard 165-3-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

18 	Weather Guard 175-3-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

19 	Weather Guard 185-3-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

20 	Weather Guard 160-3-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

21 	Weather Guard 161-3-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

22 	Weather Guard 645-X-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered  

23 	Weather Guard 665-X-01, or approved equal, in bed tool 
box 	 $ 	 $ 	 $ NO BID  
Brand and Model offered 

, 
K:lrou 	5 	LahOriRtiter:  

	

• 	.Cost  

1 	Per hour per person 	 $ 39.50 

RFP #14-049 44 



Havis 
Laird Technologies 
RAM Mounts 
Cloe Hersee 
Secure Idle 
PVP Communications 
Rigid Industries 
Unity 
Tool and Storage Boxes 
Warning lights - Nova 
Cab Steps 
Racks — all types 
Lift gates 
Service van equipment and 
shelving 
List other lines available and discount offered 
ECCO 
Able2 — ShO-ME 
Star 
Troy 
D & R 

19 
20 
21 
22 
23 
24 
25 
26 
27 
28 
29 
30 
31 
32 

33 

30% 
10% 

25% 
35% 
10% 

20% 
55% 

35% 

35% 
40% 
32% 
30% 
30% 

Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

* Applicable Tax  8.8  % 

* State correct jurisdiction to receive sales tax on the Vendor's Offer,  Form 201-B (RFP) included in this Request 
for Proposal. 

Less prompt payments discount terms of 1 %  10  days/ or net thirty (30) days. (To apply after receipt and acceptance 
of an itemized monthly statement.) For evaluation purposes, the City cannot utilize pricing discounts based upon 
payments being made in less than thirty (30) days from receipt of statement. 

Ordering and Invoice Instructions 

In order to facilitate internal control and accounting, each City Department will order and must be invoiced separately. 
Monthly invoices must be segregated by City Department number and mailed or delivered directly to the City Customer 
Department. For most materials, there will be between three (3) and six (6) ordering departments. At the time an order is 
placed, the Contractor must obtain the ordering department's cost center numbers for billing purposes. The use of the 
department's cost center numbers will be in addition to the purchase order number. Once a month, the Contractor shall 
submit a consolidated statement which shall itemize the invoice numbers, invoice date, invoice amounts, and the total 
amount billed to Accounting. Discount offering will be based upon days from receipt of the consolidated monthly 
statement. Invoice(s) shall not show previous balances. 
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Tempe Decal Price List 

vinyl decal in reflective black to read ROOF NUMBER 	 lEA $109.80 

vinyl decal in reflective black and gold to read POLICE, FRONT STRIPE, BACK STRIPE lEA $152.50 

digital cast vinyl decal to read BADGE 	 lEA $30.50 

vinyl decal in reflective white and reflective gold to read TEMPE POLICE 	 lEA $48.80 

vinyl decal in reflective black and reflective gold to read TEMPE 	 lEA $36.60 

vinyl decal in reflective white to read NUMBER 	 lEA $12.20 



Qualification Statement — LSH LIGHTS 

Please be advised that the LSH LIGHTS has a new satellite facility that is conveniently located very close 

to your operating centers, it is located at 2100 W. Obispo Ave, Gilbert, AZ. We have a 10000 sq. ft. high 

bay facility capable of holding over 20 sedans or SUV's at one time, including a gated parking area with 

video surveillance that can hold over 150 vehicles. For your information we also manage a multiple 

classification inventory of emergency lighting and warning products to support our municipal and 

private sector customers. We have been in the business of providing and installing emergency vehicle 

equipment for over twelve years. 

Consistent with your Service Specifications, LSH Lights is prepared to meet or exceed your requirements 

for Emergency Lighting equipment for the City of Tempe. We are prepared to perform in a timely and 

quality manner, as evidenced by our track record over the past few years as Police Vehicle Up fitters & 

Distributors for the municipalities of Goodyear, Surprise, Peoria, Mesa , Avondale, Buckeye, Maricopa 

County, Navajo County, El Mirage and Luke AFB. We have provided equipment for and up fitted 

Impalas, Crown Victoria's, Chargers, Taurus', Tahoe's, Expeditions, Durango's, F150's and various other 

trucks and SUV's. Because of our quality core of trained and certified installers and stringent quality 

controls, we are capable of flexing our staffing to meet your peak requirements by using dual shifts to 

maximize efficiency and timeliness. We are capable of handling large production assignments, as well 

as, individual specialty orders. All workmanship is warranted for a period of five years from the delivery 

date by LSH Lights. A review of our service performance, over the past few years, for the City of Tempe 

Purchasing Office will show that we have been providing emergency equipment and parts for your fire 

and public works vehicles at competitive prices with timely delivery. 

All employees who will be filling your orders and upfitting your vehicles will have an average of four 

years experience in upfitting and installation. 

Training of our employees is a multi-step process, all new employees apprentice for a period of 60 days 

under the watchful eye of a senior associate who cross checks all elements of build spec and quality 

control. All employees must follow specific LSH guidelines to ensure the quality and consistency of their 

work. On site specialized tech training is provided by our vendors and when appropriate employees are 

sent to the Vendor factories to attend specialized training sessions. Our company has earned 

certifications from Whelen, Tomar, Kustom Signal, Carson Siren, Code 3 and Federal Signal. 

We also have the following support services available within our complexes, Graphic installation, 

welding & fabricating, tire & battery service and automotive mechanical repair and less than a mile away 

we have access to both a Ford and GMC dealerships. 



Qualification Statement — LSH LIGHTS 

LSH Lights is a Master Distributor for all the major Emergency Lighting & Warning Manufactures and can 

not only provide the manufacturer specific technical support, but also since we stock many of the 

essential products, be in a position to provide immediate replacement product for any emergency 

vehicle equipment that might prove defective or outdated. Under your direction, we would establish 

real time replacement cycles for your required products and establish on hand stock levels to support 

your order requests. We also continue to offer Custom On-Line Ordering capability with confidential real 

time interactive ordering and record keeping functions. We believe we are the only Emergency Warning 

Install Company in Arizona that presently has this capability. 

We also provide free training classes to review the technical and advanced capabilities of your installed 

equipment such as the LED Light bar programming, camera and alarm systems. Furthermore, we would 

be pleased to offer you Warranty/ Repair Processing for any of the manufactures that we distribute 

regardless of where purchased. 

In closing, please take note that LSH LIGHTS is a Privately Owned, Arizona Based, Small Business rated 

company. We take a deal of pride in the fact that through our growth we employ and support the 

people of the County of Maricopa and the Great State of Arizona. 

BUY ARIZONA FIRST! 

2 



Addendum to Solicitation r Tempe 
City Procurement Office/City of Tempe * PO Box 5002 • 20 East 6th Street • Tempe, AZ 85280 • (480) 350-8324 a www.tempe.gov/procurement  

This addendum will modify and/or clarify: 

and is 

The Bid opening date has been changed to: 

Solicitation No.: I 14 -049 

Addendum No. I 1 

Date: 1 10/24/2013 

Procurement Description: I Vehicle Upfitting — Emergency and Utility 

Thursday, October 31, 2013 @ 3:00 PM local time 

Clarification Questions Submitted 

Question 
Page 26 and 31 Section 1 item A Are you asking that the wiring used in the aftermarket harness be of the same 

material that the vehicle manufacturer provides? I don't see where any specifications are called out for the aftermarket 

accessory wiring. There can be many variances of grades of wire and coatings. 

Answer 
Ali aftermarket wiring should be of M11.-Spec grade or approved equivalent. 

Question 

Page 27 and 32 Section 3 item C - Is there a light bar drawing or specific part number to reference the Tomar light bar. 

970 Scorpion has many various configurations to it. 

Answer 
Torpor has our specific light-bor drawing and specific model ntimber, 

Question 
Page 28 and 33 Section 4 - No siren speaker is being called out for pricing. The only mention is stainless hardware to 

mount it. 

Answer 
Tomar SPK100, or approved equivalent. 

Question 
Page 28 and 33 Section 5 item A - The part number listed is not a console part. It is a power outlet for the console. There 
are many styles of 8 inch consoles. 

Answer 
Hovis C-510-814 8` console. Mounting assembly C-IMW-GMC-02, Motion device C-MO-102. Microphone brackets 
C-11/1Ca 12V0f,7Outlet 	Mounting pole for a Tahoe CALIDIVI-203. 

Question 
Page 28 and 33 Section 5 item C - There are many docking solutions to provide suitable mounting of the dock. Is there 
specific model or item numbers Tempe is requesting for this solution? 



PO box _5:2-0 0  
TELEPHONE ADDRESS (or. PO Box) 

r. 01.)CP4(-Ae-- /(A-2 
CITY 	 /

'S 55;fr  
ST- ATE ZIP AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE / 

Answer 
Hovis OS-PAN-W-2 

Question 

Page 29 Section 10 item A and Page 34 Section 10 item A - Setina Rear prisoner partition has many models and 

configurations to choose from that effect pricing. Does Tempe have a specific part number for this on the sedans? 

Answer 	• 

No, a sedan OM polo vs. caprice) for patrol has not been decided. We cannot list port numbers for sedans at this 
• time, 

Question 

The SUV part number listed is for Sedans. There is also no rear cage listed if Setina brand is being quoted. If you are 

asking for the Full Setina Transport Solution that would include that but along with a rear storage box ;  weapon mount 

and PB450 series lighted pushbumper. 

Answer 
Set/no's website does not break down specific vehicle solutions. We want the _10-C window, with the recessed 

Please provide pricing and oplions for seating, we are not necessarily looking at a complete Selina package. 

Question 

Page 35 Section 1 item I - Is there a specific Setcom harness part number Tempe uses? There are a few different harness 

based on radio. 

Answer 
Honda 5T1300 to Motorola APX7500, Pleae provide part number's and pricing for us so that we con pick the best 
fit solution. 

The balance of the specifications and bid solicitation instructions to remain the same. Bidders/Proposal Offerors are to acknowledge 
receipt and acceptance of this addendum by returning of signed addendum with bid/proposal response. Failure to sign and return an 
addendum prior to bid/proposal opening time and date may make the bid/proposal response non-responsive to that portion of the 
solicitation as materially affected by the respective addendum. 
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NAME OF COMPANY 	 BY NAME (please print) TITLE 


