
Zip:  98402 City:  Tacoma State: 	WA 

  

Vendor's Offer 
Form 201-B (RFP) 

"Return this Section with your Response" 

It is required that Offeror complete, sign and submit the original of this form to the City Procurement Office with the 
proposal response. An unsigned "Vendor's Offer", late proposal response and/or a materially incomplete response will be 
considered nonresponsive and rejected. 

Offeror is to type or legibly write in ink all information required below. 

Company Name:  KOMPAN, Inc. 

Company Mailing Address:  930 Broadway 

Contact Person:  Shasta Bergener 	 Title: Vice President & Treasurer 

Phone No.:  (800) 426-9788 FAX:  (866) 943-6254 	E-mail:  andbesAkompan.com   

Company Tax Information: 

Arizona Transaction Privilege (Sales) Tax No.:  07639015-C 	or 

Arizona Use Tax No.: 

Federal I.D. No.: 91 -0819688 

City & State Where Sales Tax is Paid:  Tacoma Walshington 

    

If a Tempe based firm, provide Tempe Transaction Privilege (Sales) Tax No.:  nia 

THIS PROPOSAL IS OFFERED BY 

Name of Authorized Individual (Type or Print in Ink)  Shasta Bergener  

Title of Authorized Individual (Type or Print in Ink)  Vice President & Treasurer 

REQUIRED SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED OFFEROR (Must Sign in Ink) 
By signing this Vendor's Offer, Offeror acknowledges acceptance of all terms and conditions contained herein and that 
prices offered were independently developed without consultation with any other Offeror or potential Offeror. Failure to 
sign atprfAurn this form with proposal response will be considered nonresponsive and rejected. 

8/15/2014  
Date 

RFP #15 -023 



Proposal Questionnaire 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

Answer the following questions in an orderly manner and include any supporting documentation. If using additional 
sheets of paper, clearly indicate which question you are responding to. 

I. 	What is the address of the local facility to provide installation, maintenance, and warranty work on the equipment 
you are offering in your proposal? 

Safe & Sound Playgrounds, 920 E Javelina Ave, Ste 2, Mesa, AZ 85204 

2. Does the equipment you are bidding meet all ADA requirements? 
	

Yes X 
	

No 

3. Will you install the equipment or subcontract the service? If using a subcontractor provide the name, address and 
phone number. Briefly describe the subcontractor's qualifications and experience to perform this work. 

Installation Subcontractor: 

Safe & Sound Playgrounds, 920 E Javelina Ave, Ste 2, Mesa, AZ 85204 

Certified KOMPAN play equipment installer with over 8 years of experience installing and inspecting playgrounds 

4. Identify the City's contact person within your firm. Provide the person's contact information. 

Jeff Anderson, KOMPAN Sales Representative  

jefand@kompan.com   

(602) 881-0953  

5. Provide three references to which you have provided similar products and services (other municipalities and 
school districts are preferred.) Include the company name, contact name, phone number, a brief description of the 
equipment and services provided, and dates of performance. 

Prince George County, Brenda lraola (301) 699-2255 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, July 2014 

City of Hoboken, Leo Pellegrini (201) 420-2012 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, June 2013  

Avon Public School, Bruce Williams (860) 965-7462 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, Aug 2013 

Meriden Public Schools, David Paul (203) 631-2895 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, 2013 

Epping School District, Mark Vallone (603) 679-8018 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, 2013 

Clayton County, Angela Burda (770) 477-3419 - Design, supply, installation of playground equipment & surfacing, Feb 2013 

RFP #15-023 



days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

6. List all applicable warranties and guarantees. 

Limited Lifetime - please see: Attachment A - Warranty 

7. What is your anticipated delivery time after receipt of order? 

days 

Item 1: 

Item 2: 

Item 3:   

Item 4: 

Item 5: 	 

Item 6: 	 

Item 7: 	 

Item 8: 	 

Item 9: 	 

Item 10: 

Item 11: 

Item 12: 

Item 13: 

Item 14: 

Item 15: 

Item 16: 

	

Item 17: 	 

	

Item 18: 	 

	

Item 19: 	 

	

Item 20: 	 

	

Item 21: 	 

Item 22: 

Item 23: 

Item 24: 

	

Item 25: 	 

	

Item 26: 	 

	

Item 27: 	 

	

Item 28: 	 

	

Item 29: 	 

	

Item 30: 	 

Item 31 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

days 

8. Have you included descriptive literature and detailed product specifications for all proposed approved equal 
equipment and the completed bid specifications, pages 27 — 71 as required? 

9. List all the different colors that are available for the items you are bidding. 

Various - please  see: Attachment B - Color Chart 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF REQUIRED MATERIAL AND/OR 
	

QTY UNIT UNIT 
	

EXTENDED 
NO. SERVICE 
	

PRICE 
	

PRICE 

Pricing provided shall be inclusive of delivery and installation 

1. 2-5 Year Old Play Structure, Installed 
	

1 	Each 	$ 
	

$ No Bid 
Landscape Structures Weevos #130094WV or approved 
equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

2. NRG Hammock, Installed 	 1 	Each $ 
Little Tikes HRG Hammock #200201869 or approved equal 

 

$ 	No Bid 

 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

3. ADA Sand Digger, Installed 
	

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 
Burke #590-0063 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

4. Sand Digger, Installed 
	

3 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 
Burke #590-0064 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

5. Spinner Bowl, Installed 
Kompan #ELE400024 or approved equal 

KOMPAN #ELE400024 
Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

6. Explorer, Installed 

2 	Each $ 1863 	$ 3,726.00 

I 	Each $  6126 	$  6,126.00 
Kompan #ELE400008 or approved equal 

KOMPAN #ELE400008 
Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

7. 	Junior Spica, Installed 
	

1 	Each 	$  2670 $ 	2.670.00 
Kompan #ELE400158 or approved equal 

KOMPAN #ELE400158 
Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF REQUIRED MATERIAL AND/OR 
NO. SERVICE 

8. 	Spring Rider, Installed 
Playworid #ZZXX0737 Chipmunk or approved equal 
Playworld #ZZXX0721 Duck or approved equal 
Playworld #ZZXX0725 Pony or approved equal 
Playworld fIZZXX0741 Turtle or approved equal 

	

QTY UNIT UNIT 
	

EXTENDED 

	

PRICE 
	

PRICE 

Each 	$ 	 $ 	No Bid 

1 	Each 	$ 	 $ 	No Bid 
1 	Each 	$ 	 $ 	No Bid 
1 	Each 	$ 	$ 	No Bid 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

9. 	Daisy, Installed 
	

L 	Each 	$  1882 	$  1,882.00 
Kompan #M128P or approved equal 

KOMPAN #M128P 
Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

10. Seesaw, Installed 
	

I 	Each 	$ 
	

$ No Bid 
Landscape Structures #148636A or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

11. Drum Circle, Installed 
	

I 	Each 	$ 
	

$ No Bid 
Gametime #81749 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

12. Stock Car Spring Rider, Installed 
Gametime #8658 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

13. Cozy Cocoon, Installed 
Playworld #ZZXX0484 or approved equal 

2 	Each $ 

Each $ 

$ No Bid 

$ No Bid 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF REQUIRED MATERIAL AND/OR 
NO. SERVICE 

14. Spring Post, Installed 
Landscape Structures #125059C or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

15. Kid Village, Installed 
Little Tikes #QUO62585 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

16. Cave Boulder, Installed 
Playworld #ZZBD0024 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

17. Firetruck, Installed 
Playworld #ZZXX0620 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

18. 5-12 Year Old Play Structure, Installed 
Little Tikes #QU062751 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

19. Net Climber, Installed 
Landscape Structures #173755A or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

20. Curved Track Ride, Installed 
Landscape Structures #121874A or approved equal 

	

QTY UNIT UNIT 
	

EXTENDED 

	

PRICE 
	

PRICE 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

I 	Each S 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 	 $  No Bid 

Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF REQUIRED MATERIAL AND/OR 
NO. SERVICE 

21. Orbitron, Installed 
Burke #560-0532 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

22. Activo Revo, Installed 
Playworld #ZZXX0081 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

23. Vortex, Installed 
Playworld #ZZPM6810 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

24. Play Structure 5 — 12 Year Old, Installed 
Play Booster and EVOS #130094EV or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

25. Zip Line, Installed 
Playworld Live Wire #ZZXX0143 or approved equal 

	

QTY UNIT UNIT 
	

EXTENDED 

	

PRICE 
	

PRICE 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

1 	Each $ 	 $  No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

26. Swaying Bridge, Installed 1 	Each $9536 	$  9,536.00 
Kompan #COR1501 or approved equal 

KOMPAN #COR1501 

   

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

27. Vaquero, Installed 
	

1 	Each $ 
	

$ No Bid 
Playworld #ZZXX0149 or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF REQUIRED MATERIAL AND/OR 
NO. SERVICE 

28. Sway Fun Glider with Ramp, Installed 
Landscape Structures #177140B or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

29. Arch Tire Swing, Installed 
Playworld SWING-500-TIRE or approved equal 

	

QTY UNIT UNIT 
	

EXTENDED 

	

PRICE 
	

PRICE 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ 	No Bid 

1 	Each $ 
	

$ 	No Bid 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

30. Toddler Swing, Installed 2 	Each $ 

 

$ 	No Bid 

    

Landscape Structures #177336A or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

31. Three Bay Arch Swing, Installed 
	

1 	Each $ 
	

$ 	No Bid 
Miracle # 714-852-6S or approved equal 

Manufacturer & Model Number Offered 

* Applicable Tax  7.3  % 

* State correct jurisdiction to receive sales tax on the Vendor's Offer,  Form 201-B (RFP) included in this Request 
for Proposal. 

Less prompt payments discount terms of 2 % 10 days/ or net thirty (30) days. (To apply after receipt and acceptance of 
an itemized monthly statement.) For evaluation purposes, the City cannot utilize pricing discounts based upon payments 
being made in less than thirty (30) days from receipt of statement. 

Ordering and Invoice Instructions 

In order to facilitate internal control and accounting, each City Department will order and must be invoiced separately. 
Monthly invoices must be segregated by City Department number and mailed or delivered directly to the City Customer 
Department. For most materials, there will be between three (3) and six (6) ordering departments. At the time an order is 
placed, the Contractor must obtain the ordering department's cost center numbers for billing purposes. The use of the 
department's cost center numbers will be in addition to the purchase order number. Once a month, the Contractor shall 
submit a consolidated statement which shall itemize the invoice numbers, invoice date, invoice amounts, and the total 
amount billed to Accounting. Discount offering will be based upon days from receipt of the consolidated monthly 
statement. Invoice(s) shall not show previous balances. 

RFP #15-023 



Pricing Section 
"Return this Section with your Response" 

Invoices shall include: 

I. 	Listing Of All Delivery/Pickup Receipt Numbers Being Invoiced. 
2. Total Cost Per Item. 
3. Applicable Tax. 
4. Payment Terms. 
5. Blanket Purchase Order Number. 

Invoices that do not follow the above minimum invoicing requirements will not be paid. Payment must be applied to 
only invoices referenced on check/payment stub. The City reserves the right to bill contracted vendor for researching 
invoices that have been paid, but not properly applied by vendor account receivables office. 

City of Tempe 
Accounting (see below for your contact) 
P.O. Box 5002 
Tempe, Arizona 85280 
Phone: 480-350-8355 

Statement mailing address: 

Accounting Contacts: Alex Chin 
Ramona Zapien 
Danielle Plunkett 

Letters A — H and Numbers 
Letters I — Z 
General AP Inquiries and AP Checks 

RFP #15 -023 



rir Tempe 
AFFIDAVIT OF COMPLIANCE WITH TEMPE CITY CODE 

CHAPTER 2 ARTICLE VIII SECTION 2-603(5) 

Per Tempe City Code Chapter 2 Article VIII Section 2-603(5), it is unlawful for a City vendor or City 
contractor, because of race, color, gender, gender identity, sexual orientation, religion, national origin, 
familial status, age, disability, or United States military veteran status, to refuse to hire or employ or bar 
or discharge from employment any person, or to discriminate against such person in compensation, 
conditions, or privileges of employment. 

City vendors and contractors shall provide a copy of their antidiscrimination policy to City to confirm 
compliance with this requirement or attest in writing to compliance. 

• CONTRACTOR means any person who has a contract with the City. 

• VENDOR means a person or firm in the business of selling or otherwise providing products, 
materials, or services. 

CONTRACTOR/VENDOR, select one: 

Current copy of antidiscrimination policy attached 

OR 

X  I hereby certify 	KOMPAN, Inc. 	(contractor/vendor) to be in 
compliance with Tempe City Code Chapter 2 Article VIII Section 2-603(5). 

Print Name 

KOMPAN,  Inc. 
Company 

RFP #15-023 

Date: 	8/15/2014 

Vice President & Treasurer 
Title 



Attachment A 

Warranty 

KOMPAN's rigorous testing standards ensure long-lasting and durable components 

and materials, enabling us to provide an excellent warranty package. 

CLASSIFICATION OF MATERIAL  The warranty with respect to failure due to material or production defects 
on HDPE and HPL panels, and galvanized structural parts such as poles, cross 
beams, floor frames and top brackets, is Lifetime* commencing on the date of 
delivery. 

The warranty with respect to failure due to material or production defects on all 
other galvanized parts, non-painted steel and metal parts, hollow plastic parts, 
engineered timber and Robinia wood is limited to 10 years commencing on the 
date of delivery. 

The warranty with respect to failure due to material or production defects on 
springs, painted metal parts, ball bearing assemblies, and net constructions is 
limited to 5 years commencing on the date of delivery. 

The warranty with respect to failure due to material or production defects on 
moveable plastic and metal parts and all ICON electrical components is limited 
to 2 years commencing on the date of delivery. 

LIMITED WARRANTY COVERAGE 

OF DAMAGED PARTS 

This warranty applies to KOMPAN's products for the time period described for 
each product type above and with the limitations described in the warranty. The 
warranty period applies from the date of purchase by the first customer. This 
warranty covers only defects in materials. KOMPAN's liability under this warranty 
is limited to repair or replacement of defective products, without charge, at 
KOMPAN's discretion. Defective electronic components will be delivered and 
changed by a KOMPAN ICON Professional installer free of charge. 

In cases where KOMPAN invoices for installation, the labor warranty with respect 
to failure due to installation defects is limited to 1 year commencing on the date 
of completed installation. 

The warranty only applies if KOMPAN's products have been installed according 
to the instructions provided by KOMPAN, and maintained correctly according to 
the KOMPAN Maintenance Manual. 

This warranty does not cover any damage caused by accident, improper care, 
negligence, normal wear and tear, surface corrosion on metal parts, discoloured 
surfaces and other cosmetic issues or failures due to misuse or vandalism. 
Natural changes in wood over time are considered cosmetic issues and not 
covered. 

LIMITED WARRANTY COVERAGE 

OF LABOR 

WARRANTY COVERAGE APPLIES ONLY 

IF PRODUCTS HAVE BEEN PROPERLY 

INSTALLED AND MAINTAINED 

NO COVERAGE FOR WEAR, TEAR, 

MISUSE, OR VANDALISM 

PRODUCTS INSTALLED NEAR WATER  Products installed in direct contact with chlorinated water or saltwater, or 
products installed with occasional contact with such water or installed so close 
to the shore they are subjected to salt spray are not covered by the KOMPAN 
warranty for any defects caused by corrosion. 

Products installed in coastal areas, within 200 meters from the shore, will only be 
covered by the warranty for half the period of the standard product warranty in 
relation to defects caused by corrosion. KOMPAN's Lifetime warranty if applicable 
is limited to a 5 year warranty in relation to such products. 

:KOMPAN's Lifetime warranty is in effect for the lifetime of the product until the product is uninstalled and/or taken out of use. 

KOMPAN-1". 



FPK15011-0316 

EcoCore Ultramarine Blue 

PRK10011-0310 

EcoCore Yellow 

PR<10011-0317 

EcoCore Orange 

PRK10011-0309 

EcoCore Green 

PRK1a111-0301 
	

PRK10011-0305 
	

PRK1.0)1 -3306 

EcoCore Red 
	

EcoCore Black 
	

EcoCore Mgt-A Si:7 EL* 

P RK1001141311 

EcoCore Light Blue 

PRK10011-3313 

EcoCore White 

FRK10011-0315 

EcoCore Sand 

PRK10011-0323 

EcoCore Grei 

PRK10011-0326 

EcoCore Brown 

•-•. 

PRK10011-0325 

EcoCore Lime 

Attachment B 

KOMPAN COLOR OPTIONS 

HOPE EcoCore Panels 19 mm 

i ii  
Lime Turquoise Silver 	Slide Color Options 

Corocord Color Options 

Rainbow Green 	Blue 	Black 

Natural 	Yellow 	Orange Red 

Activities to  nii, „is 
'II 

1/11 	111 
Red 	Yellow 



KOMPAN! 
	 SALES PROPOSAL 

t'COROCORD 

KOMPAN, INC. " 930 Broadway, Tacoma, WA 98402 " Tel 1-888-579-8223 *Fax 1-888-579-8224* www.kompan.com  

Date 08/15/14 
Expiration Date 12/30/14 

Proposal No. SP32109 
Project Kiwanis Park 

Ship to State/Zip AZ 85281 
Customer Service Representative Kim Brown 

Sales Representative Jeff Anderson 
Payment Terms NET 30 

KOM PAN is a proud supplier partner of 

Q1 1  US COMMUNITIES'.  1 GGOCAVEERRNNNMIEENNTT PPlUIRRCCITAASSIINNI1 AVIIIIAANNCCFF 

Site Location: 27788 
Kiwanis Park 
City of Tempe 
20 E 6th Street 
2nd Floor 
Tempe, 85281 
United States 

Invoice-to: 

City of Tempe 
Procurement 
20 E 6th Street 
2nd Floor 
Tempe, AZ 85281 
United States 

27788 Ship-to: 

Kiwanis Park 
City of Tempe 
20 E 6th Street 
2nd Floor 
Tempe, AZ 85281 
United States 
Bob Pohlit 

Qty. Item No. 	 Description 
	

Unit Price 
	

Retail Price Disc. °A 	Net Price 

U.S. Communities Contract #110171 

2 	ELE400024-3717BL SPINNER BOWL 
	

970.00 
	

1,940.00 10.00 
	

1,746.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
1,000.00 
	

1,000.00 	5.00 
	

950.00 

ELE400008-3418BL EXPLORER 
	

4,770.00 
	

4,770.00 10.00 
	

4,293.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
1,590.00 
	

1,590.00 	5.00 
	

1,510.50 

1 	ELE400158-3517E 	JUNIOR SPICA 
	

1,850.00 
	

1,850.00 	10.00 
	

1,665.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
1,000.00 
	

1,000.00 	5.00 
	

950.00 

1 	M12870-12P 	DAISY,YELLOW/ORANGE In Ground 
	

920.00 
	

920.00 10.00 
	

828.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
1,000.00 
	

1,000.00 	5.00 
	

950.00 

1 	COR15011001B 	Swaying Bridge 
	

5,567.00 
2 	COR15110100 	POST 

	
959.00 

Continued on page 2 	  

	

5,567.00 	10.00 

	

1,918.00 	10.00 
5,010.30 
1,726.20 

19,629.00 



Continued from page 1 	 19,629.00 
4 	C0R15120000 	Large Aluminum Clamp 

	
149.00 
	

596.00 100.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
2,495.00 
	

2,495.00 	5.00 
	

2,370.25 

1 	COR31401101B 	Macro Spacenet 
	

16,860.00 
	

16,860.00 10.00 
	

15,174.00 
1 	INSTALLATION 	Installation 

	
5,620.00 
	

5,620.00 	5.00 
	

5,339.00 

1 	FRT-PA 

Total 

Freight for all above items, includes lift-gate 2,154.00 	2,154.00 2,154.00 

44,666.25  

    

Summary: 

Retail Price Discount 	Net Price 
Subtotal - KOMPAN Products 

	
34,421.00 3,978.50 	30,442.50 

Subtotal - Other Products 
	

0.00 	0.00 	 0.00 
Subtotal - Surfacing 
	

0.00 	0.00 	 0.00 
Subtotal - Installation & Other Services 

	
12,705.00 	635.25 	12,069.75 

Subtotal - Freight 
	

2,154.00 	0.00 	2,154.00 
Subtotal 
	

49,280.00 4,613.75 	44,666.25 

Estimated Tax Rate 
Total 

(Applicable sales tax will be added unless a valid tax exemption certificate is 

7.3% 	 provided. This amount is only an estimate of your tax liability.) 3,103.39 
47,769.64  

   

Your acceptance of this proposal constitutes a valid order request and 

includes acceptance of terms and conditions contained within the Master 

Argeement, which is hereby acknowledged. Acceptance of this proposal by 

KOM PAN is acknowledged by issuance of an order confirmation by an 

authorized KOMPAN representative. Prices in this quotation are good for 60 

days. 

This proposal may be withdrawn if not accpeted by 10/13/14. 

KOMPAN Products are "Buy American" qualified, and compliant with the Buy 

American Act of 1933 and the "Buy American"provision of the ARRA of 2009. 

KOMPAN Authorized Signature: 

Accepted By (signature): 

Accepted By (please print): 

Date: 


